To: Karyna Shuliak[ i |
Ce: Daphne Wallace/| I E

From: Richard Kahn
Sent: Thur 5/23/2019 7:25:57 PM
Subject: Re: Banguette

ok sounds good
thank you

daphne can you please update smart sheet with info below
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fax

cel
On May 23, 2019, at 1:29 PM, Karyna Shuliak </ [ j
wrote:

Hi Rich,

I don’t, but might have to find someone. It does sound crazy with Evelyn. Jeffrey told me
to hold on with this project until the decorators come, perhaps they will have
different ideas.

Should know more after our trip on June 3rd.

Thank you.

On May 23, 2019, at 1:22 PM, Richard Kahn <J NG 1 0<:

do you have any nyc people that do this work
seems very expensive and open ended..
thoughts?

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
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New York, NY 10022
tel
fax
cel

Begin forwarded message:
From: Stephanie Remington

Subject: Banquette

Date: May 23, 2019 at 1:16:44 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn < s
- P <=2
Shuliak <

Evelyne returned my call today. Normally she requires 50% down to start,
but she doesn't feel comfortable doing that with this
project because she just doesn't know what she's getting
into until she starts pulling the existing pieces apart. She
said the removal of staples alone could be 18-20 hours
per cushion, which would result in about a ten week
project.

Since she's been doing work for us for 20 years, she is wondering if we would
be willing to let her charge us just $2K, take one seat and
one seat rest, and just do those two. Then she will have a
better idea of how long this will take and consequently
how much the rest of the project will cost.

She would like to do it a few pieces at a time rather than take the whole thing
apart at once. She wants us to know that she will not take
on any other projects, but will make our project her
focus, once she begins.

Karyna, do we have a timeline on the arrival of the new fabric?
Rich, please advise how you would like me to proceed.

Stephanic Remington
LSJE, LLC
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