
To: Lesley Gro 
Cc: Rich Kahn[ 
From: Daphne W 
Sent Fri 5/24/2019 7:14:40 PM 
Subject: Re: Quote on 3rd Cistern Pump 

Greetings L, 
I spoke with Tyler. He is ordering the pump today. He will send the invoice today or Tuesday, 
but the order is going in today. 

On Fri, May 24, 2019 at 2:11 PM Lesley Groff sz > wrote: 

let us know once you speak with JCH re price for the 3rd cistern pump. JE sounded like he 
wanted it `yesterday'... 
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