To: Lesley Groff[lesley. jee@agmail.com]

From: Bella Klein

Sent: Fri 5/24/2019 3:20:31 PM

Subject: Re: Intercontinental Hotel Approved for [

she has 8Kk, i hope it will be enough or i should give her more
Thank you,
Bella

]

Tel:

On May 24, 2019, at 10:22 AM, Lesley Gmﬁ“_:- wrote:

Great. Please reserve hotel as stated below.
Bella, please be sure to fund -s card so she can pay for the room herself
thanks!

On May 24, 2019, at 10:21 AM, Natalia Molotkova
4 = WTOLE:

| can guarantee with any card, and she will pay with hers.

Disclosure (| know again, but it has to come from me):

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change.
+ Estimated total for hotel reservation: GBP1307.00. Daily resort and additional fees may apply.
Cancellation is 1 days prior to arrival,

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed.

Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-330PM EST p—

Jeffrey has approved - to stay at the Intercontinental Hotel while in London...Can we reserve the
once she is there? Or | can give you [l Amex information to reserve the room...Please advise

INTERCONTIMENTAL LONDON PARK

EFTA_R1_01115997
EFTA02287993



OMNE HAMILTON PLACE PARK LANE
LONDON GB W1J 7QY

CLASSIC ROOM
** 429.00 EFF 30MAY - 31MAY
439.00 EFF 31MAY - 02JUN

+ Estimated total for hotel reservation: GBP1307.00. Daily resort and additional fees may apply.
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