
To: 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
From: Daphne Wallace 
Sent Wed 5/29/2019 4:45:06 PM 
Subject Re: Quote on 3rd Cistern Pump 

Greetings 
Tyler placed the order for the pump last Friday 5/24. The production time is 6 weeks - the 
factory confirmed that to Tyler on Tuesday. EDA to production completion 7/5 - EDA to 
Tropical FL 7/12 - EDA on STT 7/21. 

On Wed, May 29, 2019 at 11:37 AM 

Ok. Did he give you the shipping update? When will it arrive? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 29, 2019, at 12:18 PM, Daphne Wallace 

wrote: 

wrote: 

I spoke with Tyler of JCH yesterday and told him to please invoice for the pump 
only. 

On Mon, May 27, 2019 at 7:08 AM Richard Kahn wrote: 

Do we have an invoice? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
cel 

On May 24, 2019, at 3:27 PM, Daphne Wallace 
wrote: 

Exactly. I should have the ship out date today or Tuesday the latest. 

On Fri, May 24, 2019 at 2:23 PM rote: 
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do we know ETA to receive? (nice that he will send the invoice so 
quick. ha...how about the product) 

On Ma 24 2019 at 3:14 PM, Daphne Wallace 
wrote: 

Greetings 
I spoke with Tyler. He is ordering the pump today. He will send the invoice 

today or Tuesday, but the order is going in today. 

On Fri, May 24, 2019 at 2: I 1 PM 
wrote: 

let us know once you speak with JCH rc price for the 
3rd cistern pump. JE sounded like he wanted it 
`yesterday'... 
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