
To: Stephanie Remi on 
Michael Glidden ..nque 
Cc: Rich Kahn ; Dap ne rra ace 

From: Carlos Rodriguez 
Sent: Wed 5/29/2019 3:47:42 PM 
Subject: Re: LSJ Theater drapes 

On Wednesday, May 29, 2019, 9:21:35 AM AST, Carlos Rodriguez wrote: 

Greetings all. Mrs Daphne paid with card over phone. im on my way to pik up. 
thank you 
Carlos 

On Wednesday, May 29, 2019, 8:29:58 AM AST, Ann Rodriquez wrote: 

Good morning Stephanie. 

Can you please send over $160 so Carlos can pick up the theater drapes from Island Laundries today 

Located Directly across from Crown Bay/Subbase Plaza 

Ann R. 
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