From:
Sent: Tue 6/4/2018 5:44:02 PM
Subject: Re: Cancel two tickets please..

To  Natalia Molotkoval [
—

Ok. Thanks

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 4, 2019, at 1:41 PM, Natalia Molotkova — = wrote:

Refund might take up to two billing cycles.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Thx

Sent from my iPhone

On it

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Hi Natasha...we need to cancel two tickets...one for Lionel Vilette from Miami to Paris and
one for James Cooper from Miami to London. We purchased fully refundable fare so
should receive full credit...
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7:40pm Lionel Vilette to depart MIAMI via AF99 (Rec. Loc#VUCSUI)

8:40pm fames Cooper to depart MIAMI via BAZ08 (Rec. Loc#GKUS|F)
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