
To: Jefffrey EpsteinDeeyacation@gmail.com] 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Fri 6/7/2019 9:54:44 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Milan 

Purchasing tickets for and 
I must prepay fix the ME II Duca hotel...once we pay it is non refundable. (about $450 per 
night.) 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Milan 
Date: June 7, 2019 at 4:04:55 PM EDT 
To: leslev.ieeaornail.com 

Hey Lesley , 

Can you organise a ticket for me to go to Milan (linate airport ) on monday and going 
back on Thursday Please ? 

Can you also. Organise a ticket for . She II fly From London on tuesday and 
back to London on thursday ? 

Can you also book 2 rooms at ME II Duca ? 

Thank you 

Envoye de mon iPhone 
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