
To: 
Cc: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Mon 6/10/2019 7: • 
Re: File 06.15.19 has been signed at Loews Coronado Bay Resort 

Great! Thank you Lesley! :) 

On Mon, Jun 10, 2019 at 3:08 PM, Lesley Groff a wrote: 

Locws Coronado Hotel is paid for! :) Lesley 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Sertifi Services" 
Subject: File 06.15.19 has been signed at Loews 
Coronado Bay Resort 
Date: June 10 2019 at 3:05:25 PM EDT 
To: 
Cc: 
Rep y- o: 

All signatures requested by (Loews Coronado Bay Resort) have 
been received for "Credit Card Authorization Form - English" in 

the file "06.15.19 

The signed version of the document is attached to this email. 

You may also view the signed document by accessing your account using the 
following URL: https://www.sertifi.com/loewscoronadobavresort 
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