
To: 
From: 
Sent: Tue 6/11/2019 2:58:42 PM 
Subject: Re: Sorry! 

Anna Rodd 

I put the phone down and did not hear the ETA for the drapes...when did he say they 
should be done and at the PB house? 

> on Jun 11, 2019, at 9:29 AM, Ann Rodriquez 

> no. I just wanted you to connect me with TJ to pay for the drapes 

wrote: 

>> On Jun 11, 2019, at 9:13 AM, wrote: 
>> 
>> Sorry Anna. Traffic terrible due to rain and train issues. Drove to another 
train station and was just parking. On way to Jeffrey's house now from CT. I 
should arrive around 10:45 or so! Is there something I can help with via email? 
>> 
» Sent from my iPhone 
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