
To: 
Cc: ; Daphne Wallace ann 
rodriquei 
From: Carlos Rodriguez 
Sent: Tue 6/11/2019 11:56:32 PM 
Subject: Re: Suburban 2010 

Richard Kahn 

Just to confirm, have them cut a check directly to Clifford. 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jun I I, 2019, at 4:54 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

carlos please have guardian pay vendor directly for work as opposed to us laying 
out the S 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HI3RK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

On Jun 11, 2019, at 3:55 PM, Carlos Rodriguez 
wrote: 

Greetings all I got the estimate from Clifton today, and its already been submitted to guardian 
insurance. here is a copy. 

thank you 
Carlos 
<cliff estimatc.pdf> 
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