
To: Jeffrey E teinueevacationagmail.comj 
From: 
Sent Thur 6/13/2019 2:52:57 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeff Boshulte Re Barn Permit 

Jeff says he will commence 

On Jun 13, 2019, at 10:46 AM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

tell him for the czm permits he just needs a rough footprint. we will then go for builing 
permit 

On Thu, Jun 13, 2019 at 10:44 AM > wrote: 

Jeff is still waiting for a building manufacturer to be selected. Two quotes were 
given to Mike (Allied Steel and Buck Steel) ..once a selection is made then Jeff 
can continue with the design of the foundation and interior walls... and work on 
proposal...Once proposal accepted, then he can submit for a permit. 

On Jun 13, 2019, at 10:19 AM, J icevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

find out from jeff boshulte status of barn permit. 
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