
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent ue 8 3:47:58 PM 
Subject Re: Helpl Can we get some money back from Four Season s? 

She told me Jeffrey wanted to cancel. I told her we were within cancellation policy, but I would 
try. I called AMex and tried to cancel...we were jumping through hoope She emailed me back: 
'he changed his mind' 

On Oct 16, 2018, at 11:37 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

=forgot to cancel? 
Thank you, 
Bella 
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