
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Thur 1/11/2018 8:13:34 PM 
Subject: Re: Invoice 

thank you! 
Sending and over there now 
...I believe they show c covere under the `concierge' 

On Jan 11, 2018, at 1:02 PM, Bella Klein dc > wrote: 

paid 
Thank you, 
Bella 
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