
To: 
From: 
Sent Tue 4/7/2015 6:21:25 PM 
Subject Re: Amex charge 

Hello! Probably it's a shoes.. I'm not sure. 

On Tuesday, April 7, 2015, bellaklein ‹ > wrote: 

Hi 
Would you know anything or recognize JE purchase at Bamcys on 02/28/15 - $4,534.66? 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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