
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent Wed 5/10/2017 5:06:19 PM 
Subject: Re: Invoices for 

I always use my black Amex card for medical bills 
On Wed, May 10, 2017 at 1:05 PM Bella Klein a wrote: 

i think it is for your records as its paid. How did you pay for it 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 10, 2017, at 1:03 PM, 
wrote: 

Have no idea... 
On Wed, May 10, 2017 at 1:02 PM Bela Klein wrote: 

what about labor application? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 10, 2017, at 1:01 PM, 

Thank you so much Bella! 
On Wed, May 10, 2017 at 12:47 PM Bella Klein wrote: 

paid LabCorp $367 for service on 03/23 and $367 for service on 
04/27 Dr. Berliner with Amex Black. Magnani paid prior. 
Not sure what i should do with labor application. Please advise 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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> On May 10, 2017, at 11:40 AM wrote: ,a> 
> 
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