
From: bellaklein < 
Sent: Thursday, February 20, 2014 11:43 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Amex 

It is activated and billing address is 9 east 71st ny ny 10021 

Thank you, 

Bella 

On Feb 20, 2014, at 5:31 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote= 

> Do I need to activate it? And is the billing address the same for the new c=rd ? 
> Thanks 

> Sent from my iPhone 

» On Feb 20, 2014, at 5:02 PM, bellaklein < > wrote: 

» Hi Karyna, 
» We are replacing all Visa cards. Jojo has your new Amex and he will deliv=r it to you today. 
» Visa card will stop working tonight. 

» Thank you, 
» Bella 
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