
From: Karyna Shuliak < 

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2015 4:47 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: JE Amex 

Hi Bella, 
Sorry, not sure wh=t this might be.. 

On Sep 24, 2015, at 12:26 PM =gt; wrote: 

Hi Karyna, 

09/04/2015 ONLYCOIN.CO= chttp://ONLYCOIN.COM> SAN FRANCISCO CA 117.50 

Do you=recognize charge on JE Amex. 
Thank you, 

Bella 
=br class="' 
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