
From: bellaklein < 
Sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2012 7:05 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Charge from October 20th 

Hi Karyna, 
The Spa didn't charge the credit card yet. As soon as I see the charge I will dispute it. 
Thank you for letting me know. 
Bella 

On Oct 20, 2012, at 6:48 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 

Hi Bella, 
Jeffrey has asked me to let you know this.There should be a charge around $200 later on my credit card from 

Sat. October 20th, from Faina Day Spa. Jeffrey said the place was filthy and the appointment was cancelled. So the 
charge need to be removed. 

Thank you, 
Karyna. 
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