From: caryna shuiak <

Sent: Monday, March 2, 2015 8:20 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

| paid with my debit while | was there since | couldn't get in touch with you..

On Mar 2, 2015, at 3:04 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

have bella wire or my card

On Mon, Mar 2, 2015 at 8:19 PM, Karyna Shuliak <[ G

<mailto > > wrote:

Should | use my personal card or Amex for the plastic surgery balance of 511500 for my mom?
Thank you!
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