
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2013 4:25 PM 
To: !Vet aol.com 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Heli 

yes i =ill sign however i need papers to sign please =orward thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

On Jul 31, 2013, at 12:16 PM, Ivjet@aol.com wrote: 

Yes =ich has amx card if you could help ? Thx 
 Original =essa e 
Fro 
To: Lawrence Visoski 
Cc: 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Heli 
Sent: Jul 31, =013 12:14 PM 

I don't believe I have signing power...Rich, can =ou please sign...I will certainly call Rip and confirm the trip and 
=iming...thanks Larry! 

On Jul 31, 2013, at 12:10 PM, Ivjet@aol.com =rote: 

le said ok to Bell 407 I just =ooked, I will have email confirmation in 10min, if I fwd to you, can =ou make 
amx payment for trip and sign? 

Depart E34 =treet side Pad 3pm to islip, stay 1 hour and return to NYC East Pad =4st pad. 

Rip is charter guy =ame 

=an you call him? And finalize the schedule? 
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Thx 

Larry 

Original =essage 

Fro 

To: Lawrence =isoski 

Subject: Re: =eli 

Sent: Jul 31, 2013 12:03 =M 

Hi Larry..) looked in my directory and have the below in =ommy's details...I believe this is who Tommy 
recommended in the =ast: 

Wings =elicopter 

On Jul 31, =013, at 11:57 AM, Ivjet@aol.com <mailto:Ivjet@aol.com> =rote: 

Jeffrey, 

I found a Bell 407 (single =ngine) NYC east side pad - islip for 3pm,. =br> 
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$2,820.00 

Not sure who Tommy =ses, 

can you contact Tommy and ask who he =ecommends?) 

Sent via BlackBerry by =T&T 

Sent via =lackBerry by AT&T 

Sent via BlackBerry by =T&T 
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