From:

Sent: Friday, May 24, 2019 10:34 PM
To: Molly @ Publicide

Subject: Re: Appointment for a new project
Hi =olly,

Thank you for sending the pictures. | would =ike to go ahead with the regular printing option (no letterpress) for =he
writing pages. | accept the 5175 layout fee.

Please let me =now what would be our next step.

Thank =ou.

Best,
Karyna

On May 24, 20159, at 2:44 PM, =olly @ Publicide <molly@publicide.com> wrote:
Hi Karyna,

See indented CG1 =etterpress printing and offset darker gray printing which is =lat.
You can choose any Pantone color for either =rint treatment.

The layout fee for 2 versions of covers + guts is 5175 =otal.

All =est,
Molly
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On May =1, 2019, at 11:11 AM, Molly @ Publicide <molly@publicide.com>=wrote:
Hi Karyna,
Hope all is well. =ollowing up on your writing pad project. How did the quotes look to =ou?

All =est,
Molly

On May 17, 2019, at 3:39 PM, Molly @ Publicide <molly@publicide.com>=wrote:
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