From: sarah K <[

Sent: Thursday, December 15, 2011 3:20 PM
To: Richard Barnett

Cc: I

Subject: Re: Michael's invoice

Hi Rich,

This is OK to pay.. =hanks

On Dec 15, 2011, at 10:18 =M, Richard Barnett wrote:

<lnvoice_0=doc=>
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