From: I

Sent: Thursday, December 15, 2011 5:18 PM
To: Adri Gangotena
Subject: Re: Mabilis order

thank you! Can you please send me a copy of the =rder as well with item #, price, =tc..
thanks

On Dec 15, 2011, at 4:16 =M, Adri Gangotena wrote:

Dear =-.
Below is the cc receipt for your =ecords
Thank you

MNohilis Inc

Bill =o:

301 east 66th street
new york, NY =0065
us

Account : [

Trx Type : =ale
Order : =034919 SLK Designs
Auth : APPROVED 115305

Amount : =2,520.00
Tax : 50.00
Total : 52,770.00

Cardmember =cknowledges Receipt Of
Goods and/or Services In The Amount Of
The =otal Shown Hereon And Agrees To
Perform The Obligations Set Forth By =he
Cardmember's Agreement With The =ssuer

Adri

Adri Gangotena

Senior Account Representative

Website: «:mailtc:-_:v www.nobilis.fr
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