
From: bellaklein 
Sent: Friday, September 20, 2013 8:08 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Best buy - JE Amex 

thank you 
On Sep 20, 2013, at 3:39 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 

> Hi Bella, 
> Yes, we bought large speakers for the gym. 
> On Sep 20, 2013, at 3:36 PM, bellaklein cz > wrote: 

>>> Hi Karyna, 

>>> Please help me identify JE Amex charge in NM from Best Buy - $973.66 =n August 13. I think you travel with him. 

>>> Thank you, 
>>> Bella 
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