
From: > 
Sent: Thursday, January 5, 2012 9:32 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: EUROS 

it will have to be if that's all we can take. 

On Jan 5, 2012, at 4:14 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> it is important to have them both to withdraw money in Paris. You 
> =idnt answer if it is enough cash 

> On Jan 5, 2012, at 4:11 PM, ,wrote: 

» There was a credit card and a debit card I believe. I think both are 
» =n je wallet. Will double check 

» On Jan 5, 2012, at 4:00 PM, Bella Klein <-> wrote: 

>» it was 2 cards, but now Valdson doesn't have any... what happened to =he 2nd card? 
>» On Jan 5, 2012, at 3:58 PM, wrote: 
>» 
»» Paris one should be in JE's wallet. I will be flying with him, so 
»» =e can divide the euros between us 
>>» 
»» On Jan 5, 2012, at 3:33 PM, Bella Klein < 
>>» 
>»» habe 8,000 Euros for Valdson. Do you have Paris debit card? 
>»» On Jan 5, 2012, at 3:20 PM_ wrote: 
>>>» 
>>»» yikes!thanks for reminder! i will need as many as we can carry. 
>>»» =e is planning on being away for awhile. also let me know if i should =ake for valdson On Jan 5, 2012, at 3:06 
PM, Bella Klein wrote: 
>>>>» 
>>>»» please call me, 
>>>»» thank you 

> wrote: 
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