
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, January 14, 2013 7:03 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: 

i did =ot see any attachment with wire instructions please =dvise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

On Jan 14, 2013, at 1:59 PM, Karyna Shuliak =rote: 

Rich, attached please =ind the wiring details. Please wire 10k instead of 15k, Mr. Epstein has =ust confirmed that 
with me. 

Thank =ou, 
Karyna. 

On Jan 14, 2013, at 10:09 AM, =ichard Kahn wrote: 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

On Jan 14, 2013, at 10:08 AM, Karyna Shuliak =rote: 

I am awaiting for the =etails, will let you know as I get it. 
Thank you. 
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On =an 14, 2013, at 9:59 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

can you please forward me the =iring instructions 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

On Jan 14, 2013, at 8:51 AM, Jeffrey Epstein =rote: 

pleae wire 15k dollars , to karyna mother. 

=br> 
The =nformation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be =ttorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of =he addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized =se, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in =rror, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to =a href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" 

=arget="_blank">jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
=/blockquote> 
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