
From: bellaklein 
Sent: Friday, February 6, 2015 5:41 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: JE Amex 

Great, 

Thank you for your help, 
Bella 

On Feb 6, 2015, at 12:40 PM, Karyna Shuliak > 
wrote: 

I think for NY, but he might take it to LSJ later, so not 100% sure 

On Feb 6, 2015, at 12:38 PM, bellaklein > wrote: 

Do you know for what property? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Feb 6, 2015, at 12:30 PM, Karyna Shuliak < 

> wrote: 

He has ordered 2 facial machines on that day. I guess it should be that. 

On Feb 6, 2015, at 12:26 PM, bellaklein 
> wrote: 
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Dear Karyna, 
Attached is 3 charges from Amazon on JE Amex. I was wondering if you can help with 

the charge confirmation. 

02/04/2015 AMAZON MKTPLACE PMTSAMZN.COM/BILL <http://pmtsamzn.com/BILL> WA 1,369.14 
02/04/2015 AMAZON MKTPLACE PMTSAMZN.COM/BILL <http://pmtsamzn.com/BILL> WA 1,499.88 
02/03/2015 AMAZON MKTPLACE PMTSAMZN.COM/BILL <http://pmtsamzn.com/BILL> WA 114.07 

Thank you, 

Bella 
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