
From: bellaklein 
Sent: Friday, December 12, 2014 9:14 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: JE Amex 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Dec 12, 2014, at 4:13 PM, Karyna Shuliak < > wrote: 

Hi Bella, 
Yes, for LSJ. 
Thank you! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 12, 2014, at 3:49 PM, bellaklein < > wrote: 

Hi Karyna, 
Did you purchased the following on JE Amex, if yes, for what location. 

11/28/2014 CRATEANDBARREL 621 NEW YORK NY -127.76 
11/22/2014 CRATEANDBARREL 621 NEW YORK NY 283.02 
11/22/2014 CRATEANDBARREL 621 NEW YORK NY 969.00 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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