
From: Richard Kahn C. 
Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2016 5:41 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Receipt from Leah 

please advise how item was paid for and which property it =ill reside thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 

On Jul 21, 2016, at 11:59 AM, Karyna Shuliak > wrote: 

Hi Bella, 
It is a receipt for purchase. 
Thank =ou I 

On Jul 21, 2016, at 11:51 AM, =ellaklein < 
wrote: 

Karyna, 
Is it a receipt for a purchase made or an invoice that i need =o pay? please advise 

=Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Merwin Dela cruz 

Subject: Re: Receipt from Leah 
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Date: July 21, 2016 at 11:19:39 AM EDT 

To: 

Cc: Rich Kahn  
Shuliak Bella Klein 

Leo will drop it off around =:30 and 3 pm today. 

Thanks 

Merwin Dela Cruz 

On Jul 21, 2016, at =1:13 AM 
<mailto > wrote: 

>, Karyna 

Rich, Karyna has a receipt from Leah that will be brought =ver to you...Merwin will 
organize having it brought to you.. 

Merwin, let me know who will go and when so we =an add them to the visitor list.. 
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