
From: bellaklein < 
Sent: Monday, December 15, 2014 5:09 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: LEAGUE COLLEGIATE WEAR 

did we return it and ordered different pants? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

<mailto

On Dec 15, 2014, at 11:41 AM, Karyna Shuliak > wrote: 

Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 15, 2014, at 11:41 AM, bellaklein > wrote: 

i will call them now. Will let you know 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Dec 15, 2014, at 11:40 AM, Karyna Shuliak 

crnailto > wrote: 

No, I did not, that is strange.. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 15, 2014, at 11:39 AM, bellaklein 
<mailto: > wrote: 
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Yes, I know. But this is a new charge - Dec 10th and 11th... Did you purchase more 
items? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Dec 15, 2014, at 11:36 AM, Karyna Shuliak 
<mailto » wrote: 

Hi Bella, 
This is the purchase for JE's sweatpants that I discussed with you about a month 

ago. I could not pay with my Visa because it was inactive, so you were speaking with the company, I believe you paid 
with JE's visa.. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 15, 2014, at 11:33 AM, bellaklein 
<mailtoa > wrote: 

12/11/14 -1046.24 • LEAGUE COLLEGIATE WEAR 610-272-7575 PA 
12/10/14 -898.38 • LEAGUE COLLEGIATE WEAR 610-272-7575 PA 

Hi Karyna, 
Please confirm that you made the above purchase on JE Visa. 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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