
From: bellaklein < 
Sent: Friday, June 3, 2016 7:41 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: INTERIORS BY ROYALE- JSC INTERIORS ESTIMATE 

Will you pay with your Amex Blue or same JE Amex as =abric? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 3, 2016, at 3:25 PM, Karyna Shuliak <karynashuliak@icloud.com> wrote: 

Thank you =alph. We will proceed as soon as I receive the fabric from another =endor. 
The shipping address will need to be =hanged to: 358 El Brillo Way, Palm Beach, FL 33480 
Also, =lease find attached our resale certificate as requested. 
Thank you, 
Karyna. 
<Resale =ertificate.pdf> 

Begin forwarded =essage: 

From: Ralph Monaco <ralphm@intbyroyale.com <mailto:ralphm@intbyroyale.com» 

Subject: INTERIORS BY ROYALE- JSC INTERIORS ESTIMATE 

Date: June 3, 2016 at 3:05:24 PM EDT 

To: karynashuliak@icloud.com <mailto:karynashuliak@icloud.com> 

Cc: pauletteg@intbyroyale.com <mailto:pauletteg@intbyroyale.com> 
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