
From: bellaklein < 
Sent: Friday, April 29, 2016 4:29 PM 
To: Ka na Shuliak 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: AT&T bill issue 

Karyna,, 
Please email All account login info or latest bill Thank you, Bella 

Tel: 

> On Apr 28, 2016, at 12:05 PM, Karyna Shuliak > wrote: 

> Hi Bella, 
> Would you be able to help me and. with the following issue please: 
> we have a joint AT&T account that was set up for auto-pay with our =eutsche bank account. However this months the 
payment failed, just =poke with AT&T agent, they say it is a card issue, that the payment was =eclined. Could you please 
check for us what is the issue with the card? = don't have access info in order to check it.. 
> Thanks a lot, 
> Karyna. 
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