
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

Bella Klein 
Tuesday, June 20, 2017 8:49 PM 

Drapes for apt 11P apt at 

Dear Ebby, 
Please charge =5040.27 to Amex ending on 2008. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

could forward it to Mr. Kahn. 

Hi Karyna, 

FABRIC =3D 59.75 - 25% = 44.81 X 51 = 2285.31 
FREIGHT = 76.50 
LABOR =0 MAKE THE DRAPES = 1246.10 
TRACK== 399.50 
FREIGHT = =0.00 
INSTALLATION = =82.00 
TOTAL = 4629.41 + TAX = =040.27 

All extra discounts applied as the previous job. 

Kind =egards, 

Ebb Sa hian 

Off on =ridays 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2017 6:01 PM 
To: Ebby Saghian 
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE 

Hi Ebby, 
Could you please kindly send an invoice with =he price breakdown, so that I 

Thank you very much! 
Karyna 

EFTA_R1_01169949 

EFTA02301566



On Jun 15, 2017, at 3:52 PM, Ebby Saghian = 
wrote: 

Hi Karyna, 

The estimate is just below. I sent it to you =n 6/8 

You are replying to the estimate that I =ent. 

Please let me know. the total as indicated =s 5040.27 

Kind regards, 

Ebby Saghian 

Off on Fridays 

From: Karyna Shuliak 

Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2017 2:56 PM 

To: Ebby Saghian 
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Subject: Re: =STIMATE 

Hi Ebby, 

This is Karyna. I haven't heard back =rom you regarding the estimate for the 
apt.11P =roject. 

Please advice. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jun 8, 2017, at 11:45 AM, =bby Saghian 
=rote: 

Hi Karyna, 

I just =eft you a message. 

I =hecked the fabric and it is available as of now. it is a little more =han the 
other fabric. 

I =iscounted all just like your privious and the total of this job will be =040.27 
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Please let me know. 

Kind regards, 

Ebby Saghian 
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