
From: 
Sent: Monday, March 12, 2012 7:08 PM 
To: Adri Gangotena; Marguerite Jamesley 
Subject: Re: Nobilis order 

Hello Adri and Marguerite. I would like to order 5 =ore yards of the Koala fabric 49516 and have it shipped to the same 
=ddress as before in the invoice below. Can you please confirm this is =n stock? Thank you! 

On Dec =6, 2011, at 11:47 AM, Adri Gangotena wrote: 

Attached please find the preliminary invoice. The final invoice =ill be mailed to you after the order ships. 
Please disregard the NJ in the =hip to address. This is the only way our system will take an =ddress outside of 

the US 
Thank you 
Adri 

Tel: 
Fax: 
Email: 
<image .jpg> 

From:
Sent: Thursday, December 15, 2011 =:18 PM 
To: Adri =angotena 
Subject: Re: Nobilis =rder 
thanks 

Deal= 
Below is the cc receipt for =our records 
Thank =ou 

Adri Gangotena 
Senior Account Representative 

<InvoicePDF-SIK =esign.pdf> 
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