
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Monday, June 5, 2017 11:39 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Wire instructions to DB 

Great , it should be ok for abou= 8 month of rent and telephone bill 

Thank you, 

Be=la 

On Jun 5, 2017, at 7:14 PM, Karyna Sh=liak wrote: 

Thank you Bella! I completed the wire transfer. I wired $16000 to the Deut=ch account, since the deposit I had 
on my chase account was in the amount o= $15,877.08 

If I need to wire more, please let me know. 
Karyna 
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On Jun 5, 2017, at 1:46 PM, Bella Klein > wrote:<=r> 

Account number: 
Bank Routing number: 
Bank nam=: DEUTSCHE BANK TRUST CO AMERICAS 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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