
From: Karyna Shuliak < 
Sent: Thursday, April 30, 2015 4:21 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Cc: ; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Amex 

Hi Bella, 
FYI: JE told me to=ay to extend the car rental for this weekend, so will need to pay mor= with her card. 
Thank you, 
Karyna. 

On Apr 30, 2015, at 10:33 AM, bellaklein < <mailto > wrote: 

Hi M, 
Yesterday i increased your limit $5=0 for car rental as per JE request. As you can see from below other 

charges=were made that exceeded your limit of $3500 by $329.71. That was the reason=that Hertz charge was declined. 
Please explain charges other than Hertz. I n=ed to lower your limit back to $3000 unless you will receive JE appro=al for 
a higher limit. You can start using your card after May 10th.<=div> 

APR29 
EQUINOX-63RD 
l $193.00WALGREENS1430290800000=a title="Show Details" id="iproc_2" class="plus plusGrey" 

href="htt=s://online.americanexpress.com/myca/estmt/us/list.do?request_type=authreg=Statement&Face=en_US&BPI 
ndex=l&sorted_index=4&intlink=3DSOAFins-GotoOnlineStatementr style="margin: 0px; border: Opx; padding:=0px; 
list-style-type: none; text-decoration: none; font-size: 0.8182em; lin=-height: 1.2em; color: rgb(83, 83, 83); cursor: 
pointer; background-image: 
u=l(https://online.americanexpress.com/myca/shared/summary/estatement/imagesRprites/sprite-small2015-Rl.png); 
width: 8px; height: 13px; font-family: 'Co=rier New, Courier; display: inline-block; background-position: -125px -156=x; 
background-repeat: no-repeat no-repeat;"> 

APRO=LINE PAYMENT PROCESSED BY STRIPE.COM1430377200000 
<https://online.americ=nexpress.com/myca/estmt/us/list.do?request_type=authreg_Statement&Fac==en_US&BPIndex 
=l&sorted_index=4&intlink=SOAFins-GotoOnl=neStatement#> 

APR30 
ONLINE PAYMENT PROCESSED BY STRIPE.COM <http://STRIPE.COM> 

$10.00STRIPE.COM=/a> 
$79.75 

Items 
Total P=nding Charges$722.71 
Thank you, 

Bella 
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