
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, March 13, 2012 9:53 PM 
To: Adri Gangotena 
Cc: Marguerite Jamesley 
Subject: Re: Nobilis order 

Hi Adri, 
J=st checking in about this order. Thanks.. 

On Mar 12, 2012, at 4:46 P=, Adri Gangotena < <mailto:adri.gangotena@nobilis-
usa.com> wrote: 

Dear =, 

I am getting the freight quote fro= my forwarder for the additional 5 yds. I will get back to you tomorr=w 

Tha=ks 

<=:p> 

Adri=/p> 

</=> 

Adri Gangotena 

Senior Account Represen=ative 

Tel:&n=sp; 

Fax: 

Email: <mailto 

Website: www.nobilis.f= <http://www.nobil=s.fr> 
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From:</=> [mailto 
Sent: Monday, Mar=h 12, 2012 3:08 PM 
To: Adri Gangotena; Marguerite Jamesley 
=ubject: Re: Nobilis order 

Hello Adri and Margue=ite. I would like to order 5 more yards of the Koala fabric 49516 and have i= shipped to the same 
address as before in the invoice below. Can you please=confirm this is in stock? Thank you! 

&n=sp; 

On Dec 16, 2011, at 11:47 AM,=Adri Gangotena wrote: 

&nbs=; 

Dear M, 

<=pan style="font-size:11.0pt;font-family:"Calibri","sans-se=ir;color:#1F497D">Attached please find the preliminary 
invoice. =The final invoice will be mailed to you after the order ships.<=o:p> 

Please d=sregard the NJ in the ship to address. This is the only way our syste= will take an address outside of the US 

Thank you 

=/div> 

Adri 

<= class="MsoNormal"> 

Adri Gangotena<=:p> 

Senior=Account Representative 

Tel: 

Fax: 

Email: <mailto 

Website: www.nobilis.fr <http://www.nobilis.fr> 

</=:p> 
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color:initial"› 

From: [mailto > =/span> 
Sent: Th=rsday, December 15, 2011 4:18 PM 
To: Adri Gangotena 
Subject: Re: Nobilis order 

<=div> 

thank you! Can you please send me a copy of the order as w=lI with item #, price, etc.. 

On Dec 15= 2011, at 4:16 PM, Adri Gangotena wrote: 

Nobilis Inc 

Bill To: 
<=r> 

Account: 
Trx Type : Sale&nb=p; 
Order : 9034919 
Auth : APPROVED 115305 

A=ount : $2,520.00 
Tax : $0.00 
Total : $2,770.00 

Cardmember Ackn=wledges Receipt Of 
Goods and/or Services In The Amount Of 
The Total S=own Hereon And Agrees To 
Perform The Obligations Set Forth By The Car=member's Agreement With The Issuer 
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Adri 

=/div> 

</=pan> 

Adri Gangotena 

Senior Account Representative<=:p> 

Email:<=pan style="font-size:9.0pt;font-family:"Calibri","sans-ser=f""> 
<mailto 

Web=ite: 4=pan>www.nobilis.fr <http://www.nobilis.fr> 

=p class="MsoNormal"> 

<=iv> 

cimage001.jpg>40:p> 
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