
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 11:30 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Trip to St. Barth's 

Thank yo'! Will talk to Jeffrey.. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Nov 10, 2014, at 4:31 PM,  wrote: 

> Hi Karyna...l have a ticket on HOLD for you with Amex to go NY-St. Barth'. Dec. 28th and St. Barth's-NY on Jan. 7th. 
This reservation will expire to=orrow (Rec. Loc#UBMETW). As we discussed...the NY/San Juan round trip port=on I can 
purchase as a fully refundable...however, the hop from San Juan/St= Barth's and back on Tradewind can only be 
purchased as non refundable...th= cost is $1244.00. We would not get our money back. Please speak to Jeffr=y and 
advise what we should do... 

> In the interim, I have requested the Tropical Hotel place your name either=alongside Svetlana's on the reservation 
Dec. 28-Jan 7 or replace the name w=th yours. I will probably hear back tomorrow on this. 

> Thanks, 
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