
From: > 
Sent: Friday, March 16, 2012 2:18 PM 
To: Bradford Jones 
Subject: Re: 5 palm 

I will double check on the padding. 
Can you please let me know what your records show our balance as? I'm having Rich our accountant work it out as well, 
but want to make sure we are on the same page. Thanks 

On Mar 16, 2012, at 10:06 AM, Bradford Jones wrote: 

Hi=, 

We have worked out the credit balance. Just want to know if you need the antimicrobial padding as well for this 
wall to wall install? I had not included it in the initial quote. Please confirm, thanks! 

Bradford Jones 

SACCO CARPET 

520 Broadway 

6th Floor 

New York, NY 10012 

From: 
Sent: Wednesday, March 14, 2012 2:43 PM 
To: Bradford Jones 
Cc: Kim Steube 
Subject: Re: 5 palm 
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Thanks Brad. I wanted to confirm we still have credit enough to cover the 50% deposit? 

On Mar 14, 2012, at 2:22 PM, Bradford Jones < 
> wrote: 

<mailto 

Please find the quote attached which includes freight to NJ. Please let us know if you have any 
questions. Thanks! 

Bradford Jones 

SACCO CARPET 

520 Broadway 

6th Floor 

New York, NY 10012 

T: 

F: 

back to you? 

From: 
Sent: Wednesday, March 14, 2012 2:06 PM 
To: Bradford Jones 
Cc: Kim Steube 
Subject: Fwd: 5 palm 

HI Brad, 

Here is the front of the carpet. are pictures good enough, or would it be best to have the sample sent 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: Arran McGinnis < 

Subject: S palm 

Date: March 12, 2012 5:17:31 PM EDT 

To: 

<image002.jpg> 

Sent from my iPhone 

<S404KS.pdf> 

>>> 

> > 
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