
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, March 26, 2012 3:06 PM 
To: Kim Steube 
Cc: Sarah K 
Subject: Re: SLK-Dining Rm 

thank you for the long awaited email however your =ricing is still crazy for dining room rug can you please revisit =his 
price as Marc told me you are dealing with new factories and that =e have received a competitive quote around =6,000 

Richard =ahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite =OF 
New York, NY 10065 

On Mar 26, 2012, at 11:03 AM, Kim Steube wrote: 

Hi Sarah, 
I am sorry about the confusion on the 25% =ayments. This was my error for not explaining our arrangement =ith 

my assistant Bradford. I have attached the =pdated price for the dining room and the remaining credit which =ncludes 
the new dining room rug. Please review and let me know if =ou have any questions. 

Rich- if you =ave any questions on the balance credit amount, please call =e. 

Thank you, 
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