
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, April 4, 2012 8:50 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: Proposal from Dulles Glass and Mirror 
Attachments: SLK Designs-acrylic mirrors.pdf, Untitled attachment 00061.htm 

Quote =ttached for the acrylic mirror for 672 sq feet, $1,122.19. They came up =ith a rough sizing of the panels as 
48"x31.5", 8 panels needed, based =n the wall dimensions I gave them. We can do whatever dimensions or =izing that 
you would want though. 

Begin =orwarded message: 

From: Stephanie Carroll =lt;

Subject: Proposal from Dulles Glass and =irror 

Date: April 4, 2012 4:07:16 PM EDT 

To: ' 

=br> 

Dear Slk designs : 

Thank you =or your interest in Dulles Glass and Mirror. Per your request I =repared a proposal for your review. 
You will find the details of the =roposal by clicking on the link provided in this email. If you have any =uestions please 
contact me at or simply reply to this =mail. If you call, please have your proposal handy, so I can answer 
=our questions quickly. 

Please click here to view your quote. 

Best regards, 

Stephanie Carroll 
Sales Coordinator 
Dulles Glass and =irror <http://www.dullesglassandmirror.com/> 

Security Information 
E-mail intended for: Slk designs = 

This e-mail sent to To ensure =hat you continue receiving our emails, please add 
info@dullesglassandmirror.co= to your address book or safe =ist. 

EFTA_R1_01177184 
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If you feel this e-mail was delivered to you in error, or that you may have =een included in an unsolicited mailing, please 
report this incident =mmediately to abuse@dullesglassandmirror.com. 

Dulles Glass and Mirror respects =our privacy. Information regarding your personal information can be viewed =t 
=ttp://www.dullesglassandmirror.com/legal/privacy.asp 

If you are concerned about the =uthenticity of this message, please call us at 

Copyright © 2011 Dulles Glass and Mirror. All Rights =eserved. 
Designated trademarks and brands are the property of their respective owners. Dulles Glass and =irror is located 

at 9129 Euclid Ct., Manassas, VA 20110. 
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