
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 7:13 PM 
To: Ammon&Rousseau Translation 
Cc: Jen Kahn 
Subject: Re: Quote for translations 

Sorry, = accidentally sent the previous email =nfinished. 

Lenora, thank you for the update! Yes I =ive my ok for the price. 
Thanks a =ot, 
Karyna. 

will pick it up on Friday by 6:30 pm =nd pay. 

On Aug 13, =014, at 2:58 PM, Ammon & Rousseau Translations <ammon-rousseau@nyc.rr.com>= wrote: 

Hello, 

The price for =he certified translation for Friday of =5(?) pages is $700. 

The translator will try and =ave everything done of Friday. I told her =bout the priorities that Karyna gave me 
=nd those (breast =ltrasound, =font color=" 111F4970" face="Calibri">mammography, blood =est) will be the first 
translations delivered Friday =orning. The others will follow =ith the objective of everything by 6:30 PM. 

Karyna said that I have her OK for the price. 

But now that you know what it is, please send your =K. 

Regards, 

Lenora 

=mmon-Rousseau Translations 

Accredited by the French Consulate =n New York 

&nbs=; 243 East 78th Street 

&nbs=; New York, NY 10075 

&nbs=; 

&nbs=; ammon-rousseau.com 
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From: 
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 12:32 PM 
To: Ammon & Rousseau Translations 
Subject: Shuliak PDF (3 of =) 

« File. 777777771.pdf =gt;> « File. " 7" 7"2.pdf  » « =ile. " 7" 7"2  - 7" 77  pdf » « File. " 2" 7""

 pdf >> « File: 77, "7777,7 7,?7,7 ??77 -7277,77  pdf >> « File: ?V> 77?7777 ),???? )777 -,?777  pdf >> 
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