
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2013 3:55 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: Chase Visa statement July 2012 - Karyna 

Thanks Bella, there should not be any charge from the Palm, I once spoke with them on the phone planning to order, 
but nev=r did as the order was to small for delivery. 

On Tuesday, Jul= 16, 2013, bellaklein wrote: 

God Morning Karyna, 
I think it was a charge from Palm restaurant. They often bill as Jet Din=ng... I asked for a copy of the receipt, will 

forward to you when i receiv= it. 
Thank you, 
Bella 
On Jul 15, 2013, at 9:45 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 

> Hi Bella, 
> I confirm the charges, the are 2 statements attached from june/july an= may/june. On the june/july statement 

there is one charge from Jet dining,=that I marked as "not sure what this is", I don't know what =t could be. 
> Thank you, 
> Karyna. 
> On Jul 15, 2013, at 2:37 PM, bellaklein <javascript:;>  wrote: 

» Hi Karyna, 
» Attached please find your CVC statement for July. Please confirm a=l charges. 

» Thank you, 
» Bella 
» <NES_CVC_Karyna_stetement_071113_sore notes.xls> 
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