
From: 
Sent: Friday, March 16, 2012 5:09 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: how much EUROS for JE? 

> 

Yep. It ok since we are taking plane and can divide with Larry if need be. Thanks 

On Mar 16, 2012, at 1:05 PM, Bella Klein < 

have 6835 for Valdson, and 6000 for JE, OK? 

On Mar 16, 2012, at 1:01 PM, wrote: 

Whatever the max is 

On Mar 16, 2012, at 12:54 PM, Bella Klein < 

This message has no content. 

<mailto > wrote: 

<mailto > wrote: 
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