From: Colette McGoldrick <colette@floordepotny.com>

Sent: Friday, June 1, 2012 1:09 PM

To: ‘Sarah K’

Subject: RE:

Attachments: SARA 8H COUNTRY WHITE BASEBOARD.doc; SARA 11P COUNTRY WHITE
BASEBOARD.doc

Hi Sarah,

Attached are the 2 invoices for 8H and 11P. We should be completely finished the apts today.
Thanks

Colette

-----Original Message-----

From: Sarah K [mailto:sarahk525@me.com]
Sent: Friday, June 01, 2012 8:54 AM

To: Colette McGoldrick

Subject:

Hi Colette,
Can you pls let me know the total cost of the floors with the baseboards for both apts BH and 11P please. I'm just
putting together the full budget of the apts and need to include this price. thanks very much, Sarah
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