From: I | -

Sent: Saturday, June 2, 2012 1:36 PM
To: Michael Weinstein
Subject: Re:

Will you take 56500 all in?

On May 31, 2012, at 7:19 AM, Michael Weinstein wrote:

Hi [
My original estimate would bill out $8000 for 50 shots at a rate of 5160 per shot. Mr. Epstein is asking for 5000
for 50 shots at a rate of 5100 per shot. A 5100 per shot is tight for me. Would Mr. Epstein be willing to meet me in the

middle at $130 per shot for a total of 565007 Also, | will need an assistant for two days at a rate of 5300 per day.
Thanks, Michael

On Wed, May 30, 2012 at 7:49 P, [ EEEEEEEEEEE - - I -

wrote:

Thank you Michael. Mr Epstein said he would need 50 shots of each house. They are each quite large
and is wondering if you would do the NY house for 55,000 for 50 shots?

On May 30, 2012, at 6:16 PM, Michael Weinstein <[ [ GTcG_—_ < -

= wrote:

a1 |

Mice talking to you today. My fee would be 52000 and that would include 10 fully retouched hi-
res photographs. Any additional photos would be 5150 per shot. Also, | will need an assistant and that would be $300.
My fee covers photography fee. transportation, electronic proof sheets, and your 10 selects. Feel free to email or call if

you have any more questions. Best, Michael

On Tue, May 29, 2012 at 8:32 PM, Michael Weinstein <|||| | EGTGTNGGGG
<mailto - > wrote:

Hi - Thanks for your inguiry. | will give you a call in the morning. Best, Michael

On Tue, May 29, 2012 at 7:04 pv, | NN I
=:mailtu—> > wrote:
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Hello Michael,

My name is - | work for Jeffrey Epstein. We got your contact info from
Deborah Grubman. Jeffrey is interested in having 2 of his homes photographed by you; his town house in NY, his island
in the Virgin Islands, and his ranch in New Mexico. My number is [ | [N <t<' S «hen you have a
moment to discuss. Thank you! -
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