
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Friday, June 8, 2018 3:59 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Shipping invoice Bali 

Thank you! 

> On Jun 8, 2018, at 10:36 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> Wire sent 

> <DB_LSJE_WT_Nikini Art Indonesia_Benedictus Banamtuan _060818_shipping cha=ges from 4 companies backup.pdf> 

> Thank you, 
> Bella 

» On Jun 7, 2018, at 9:48 PM, Karyna Shuliak ro=e: 

» Hello to All, 

» This is another shipping invoice that I received from Benedictus. 
» Please advice if ok to proceed. 

» Thank you, 

» Karyna 

> <PHOTO-2018-06-07-21-37-42.jpg> 
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