From: Karyna Shuliak

Sent: Tuesday, June 5, 2018 3:
To: Bella Klein
Subject: Re: Shipping invaice

Thank you Bella.
| sent another message to Benny about the shipping invoice on his WhatsAp= . 5till waiting to hear back...

On Jun 5, 2018, at 10:08 AM,=Bella Klein -FG[E‘.

All 4 vendors are paid in full. Waiting for shipping charges wire inst=uctions from Benedictus.

Thank you,
Bella

0n 1=n 4, 2018, 3t 206 PM, Karyna shuiak
I, - ot

Hi Bella,
Thank you,<=div>

On Jun 4, 2018, at 12:58 PM, Bella I(Ieinz_f:::-:- wrote:

Hi Karyna,
Please advise o= balance payment for the other companies in Bali.,

Nikini - 5890
Global A=t - $920
Liyana Paulus $928.59

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:=span class="Apple-tab-span” style="white-space: pre;"> 212-=71-1307
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On Jun 2, 2018, at 2:44 PM, Karyna Shuliak_
I ot

Good afternoon to=All!

Please see b=low the shipping invoice for Bali furniture.

Please le= me know if it is ok to proceed.

Also, Miroku vendor a=ked me to send the remaining balance to their Indonesian
account, since the=e is some problem with USD one.

<=jv class="">Thank you,

Karyna

Begin forwa=ded message:

From: Benedictus Banamtuan <<= href="{|5G5GTcTczIEINGEEE
class="GGNGNGGGEE - - june 1, 2018 at 6:50:29 PM EDT

<= class=""=5ubject: Shipping invoice

<=r class="">

Dear Karyna,

<=pan style="-webkit-text-size-adjust: auto; background-color: rgba(255, 25=,
255, 0);" class=""=For payment you can transfer to My account Bank.&nbs=;
The date for pick up=depend when do you paid the things in each shop.

Regards

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail=untuk iPhone
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