
From: Anthony Barrett < 
Sent: Thursday, May 24, 2012 3:19 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: 

Danny can do the one way mirror the way I explained to him The price =or the sliding door will be $3,000.. This is about 
$1,000 more than a =egular custom door. 

Call him if you want to go ahead. 

On May 23, 2012, at 4:59 PM, wrote: 

> I really appreciate your help. I feel at such a loss sometimes with =hese things. 

> On May 23, 2012, at 10:48 PM, Anthony Barrett <-> wrote: 

» I believe that the thickest one-way mirror glass is 1/4" The option = have discussed with a glass manufacturer is using 
this and then =aminating another piece of glass onto this. I will discuss this with =anny directly and get back to you. 

» On May 23, 2012, at 4:30 PM, wrote: 

>» Thank you so much. JE is not going to believe me that it doesn't =xist, but if I have enough people agreeing with 
that, maybe he will =ccept it! 
>» 
>» On May 23, 2012, at 9:29 PM, A Barrett <-> wrote: 

»» I have not seen this before. I will search it online and see what I =an find. I had them remove the saddle in 8h. 
>>» 
»» Anthony Barrett 
>>» 
>>» 
»» On May 23, 2012, at 3:02 PM, > =rote: 
>>» 
>»» Have any of you ever heard of or seen mirrored sliding shower =oors? J wants to put mirrored shower doors on 
the tub in 8H and I can't =ind them. 
>»» Anthony, Danny has never seen them himself, but I was wondering if =ny of you have? 

» Anthony Barrett 
» Ossa Properties, Inc. 
» 301 East 66th St 
» NY NY 10065 
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>> 

Anthony Barrett 
Ossa Properties, Inc. 
301 East 66th St 
NY NY 10065 
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