
From: Daphne Wallace 
Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2012 7:58 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Greetings S - Do you have an invoice for the Bronze shields? Thanks, DW 

Greetings. 

Thank you - and Yes, the desk w=s delivered to LSJ on 5/17/12, DW 

On Tue, May 29, 2012 at 2:45 PM, wrote: 

just got back to NY. I can look through the house books an= see if I can find anything for the cost. 
Also, checking if the large desk for 5 Palms is on site yet? 

On May 29, 2012, at 3:20 PM, Daphne Wallace wrote: 
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